BID TABULATION

WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT IMPROVEMENTS - CONTRACT A

VILLAGE OF PEMBERVILLE
SEPTEMBER 25, 2009

10f3
Mosser Construction Kirk Bros. Co., Inc. IPS Rudoliph/Libbe Inc.
Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
BASE BID
1 Base Bid — All General Work ltems 1 LUMP _ [1$1,939,960.00| $1,939,960.00]{$1,963,500.00| $1,963,500.00] $1,974,000.00{$1,974,000.00{$1,977,451.00| $1,977,451.00
ALTERNATE 1
2 Remove Existing Fence 1895 FEET $5.25 $9,948.75 $3.20 $6,064.00 $2.22 $4,206.90 $3.64 $6,897.80)
3 |iChain Link Fencing 1895 FEET $14.95 $28,330.25 $15.40 $29,183.00, $15.62]  $29,599.90 $14.60 $27,667.00
Subtotal of all Alternate 1 ltems $38,279.00 $35,247.00 $33,806.80 $34,564.80
ALTERNATE 2
4 411 — Stabilized Crushed Aggregate 17 cUyYD $60.00 $1,020.00 $86.00 $1,462.00 153.00 $2,601.00 $105.41 $1,791.97
5 448 — AC Surface Course, Type 1 PG64-22 100 CU YD $164.00 $16,400.00 $160.16 $16,016.00 118.00]  $11,800.00 152.65 $15,265.00]
6 401 — Tack Coat 155 GAL $2.20 $341.00, $5.00 $775.00 $4.50 $697.50 $4.67 $723.85
Subtotal of all Alternate 2 ltems $17,761.00 $18,253.00 $15,098.50 $17,780.82
TOTAL OF BASE BID PLUS
ALTERNATES 1 AND 2 $1,996,000.00 $2,017,000.00 $2,022,905.30 $2,029,796.62
PART 2 - ELECTRICAL WORK
ltem 7 - Electrical Work Bid by Part 1 Bidder
Lump Sum Total $228,000.00, 264,000.00 No Bid $210,022.00
Deduct Offered if part 1 Is Awarded to Bidder $32,000.00 100,000.00, $20,000.00
PART 3 - PLUMBING, HEATING/VENTILATION WORK
Iltem 8 - Plumbing, Heating/Ventilation work by Part 1 Bidder
Lump Sum Total $35,000.00 $78,000.00 49,000.00 36,576.00
Deduct Offered if part 1 Is Awarded to Bidder $8,000.00) $50,000.00 20,000.00! 10,000.00
PART 2 - ELECTRICAL WORK BID (ELECTRICAL WORK ONLY)
Item 9 - Electrical Work bid By Non-Part 1 Bidder
Lump Sum Total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PART 3 - PLUMBING, HEATING/VENTILATION WORK BID
(Plumbing, Heating/Ventilation Work Only)
ltem 10 - Plumbing, Heating/Ventilation Work Bid by Non-Patrt 1 Bidder
Lump Sum Total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Deduct Offered if part 1 Is Awarded to Bidder
* - Bid Requested To Be Withdrawn
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BID TABULATION

WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT IMPROVEMENTS - CONTRACT A

VILLAGE OF PEMBERVILLE
SEPTEMBER 25, 2009

20f3
Peterson Construction Zachrich Leasing, Inc. Hank's Plumbing &
Company Heating Company
ltem Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
BASE BID
1 Base Bid — All General Work ltems 1 LUMP  11$2,074,000.00|$2,074,000.00}1$2,192,549.00{$2,192,549.00}$2,439,671.00{ $2,439,671.00
ALTERNATE 1
2 Remove Existing Fence 1895 FEET $3.54 $6,708.30 $5.80 10,991.00 $4.40 $8,338.00
3 Chain Link Fencing 1895 FEET $13.90 $26,340.50 $15.99 30,301.05 $15.60 29,562.00
Subtotal of all Alternate 1 Items $33,048.80 $41,292.05 $37,900.00
ALTERNATE 2
4 411 — Stabilized Crushed Aggregate 17 CU YD $78.00 $1,326.00] 64.00 1,088.00 $75.00 $1,275.00
5 448 — AC Surface Course, Type 1 PG64-22 100 CUYD $151.25]  $15,125.00 84.00 8,400.00 $150.00 $15,000.00
6 401 — Tack Coat 155 GAL $4.45 $689.75 $133.00f  $20,615.00 $5.00 $775.00
Subtotal of all Alternate 2 Items $17,140.75 $30,103.00 $17,050.00

TOTAL OF BASE BID PLUS

ALTERNATES 1 AND 2

$2,124,189.55

$2,263,944.05|

$2,494,621.00

PART 2 - ELECTRICAL WORK

ltem 7 - Electrical Work Bid by Part 1 Bidder

Lump Sum Total No Bid $213,760.00 $184,700.00
Deduct Offered if part 1 Is Awarded to Bidder $13,000.00 $0.00
PART 3 - PLUMBING, HEATING/VENTILATION WORK
Item 8 - Plumbing, Heating/Ventilation work by Part 1 Bidder
. Lump Sum Total $40,000.00] $54,168.00 $20,500.00 *
Deduct Offered if part 1 Is Awarded to Bidder $10,000.00| $6,000.00 $0.00
PART 2 - ELECTRICAL WORK BID (ELECTRICAL WORK ONLY)
ltem 9 - Electrical Work bid By Non-Part 1 Bidder
Lump Sum Total No Bid No Bid $244,700.00
PART 3 - PLUMBING, HEATING/VENTILATION WORK BID
(Plumbing, Heating/Ventilation Work Only)
Item 10 - Plumbing, Heating/Ventilation Work Bid by Non-Part 1 Bidder
Lump Sum Total No Bid No Bid $61,500.00
Deduct Offered if part 1 Is Awarded to Bidder| $0.00

* - Bid Requested To Be Withdrawn
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Bid Tabulation

Wastewater Treatment Plant Improvements - Contract A

Electric Contract

Village of Pemberville
September 25, 2009

30f3
Transtar Electric Retzke/Snyder Lake Erie Regent Electric AT. Emmett, LLC Westfield Hank's Plumbing
Electrical Contractors Electric of Toledo Electric, Inc. & Heating
ltem Description Quantity Unit  [Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
PART 2 - ELECTRICAL WORK BID (ELECTRICAL WORK ONLY) 1 LUMP
item 9 - Electrical Work bid By Non-Part 1 Bidder
Lump Sum Total $154,360.00 $173,050.00 $174,550.00 $188,777.00] $201,240.00 $203,582.00) $244,700.00
BID TABU! ATION
WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT IMPROVEMENTS - CONTRACT A
VILLAGE OF PEMBERVILLE
September 25, 2009
Marine Building R.A. Rush Hank's Plumbing
Group, Inc. Plumbing & Heating & Heating, Inc.
ltem Description Quantity Unit__ |Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
PART 3 - PLUMBING, HEATING/VENTILATION WORK BID
(Plumbing, Heating/Ventilation Work Only)
ftem 10 - Plumbing, Heating/Ventilation Work Bid by Non-Part 1 Bid 1 LUMP
Lump Sum Total, $29,800.00] $30,475.00 $61,500.00
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